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How do you respond to a dinner invitation that says "Eight for eight thirty"? What might induce you to get
off a London train at a place called Mud Chute? When is it okay to drive over a sleeping policeman? And
why do teh Brits keep saying "Who's she, the cat's mother"?

Rules, Britannia is an invaluable resource for Americans who want to make a smooth transition when
visiting or relocating to the UK. This entertaining and practical insider's guide contains scores of established
do's and dont's that only a Brit would know.

Most of us know that an elevator is called a "lifet," a toilet is a "loo," and the trunk of your car is the "boot,"
but who would have a clue about a "sprog" or a "gobsmacked berk"? These phrases are part of daily
conservation in the UK, and leave many visiting Americans as baffled as if they listening to a foreign
language.

Covering such essential topics as vocabulary, house- or "flat"-hunting, business culture, child rearing, and
even relationship etiqutte, Rules, Britannia will ease the anxiety that comes with a transatlantic move or
extended visit, and is sure to make any old Yank feel like a regular Joe Bloggs.
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From reader reviews:

Richard Slawson:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content. As it is
known to us that book is very important for us. The book Rules, Britannia: An Insider's Guide to Life in the
United Kingdom has been making you to know about other information and of course you can take more
information. It is quite advantages for you. The publication Rules, Britannia: An Insider's Guide to Life in
the United Kingdom is not only giving you far more new information but also for being your friend when
you experience bored. You can spend your current spend time to read your guide. Try to make relationship
with the book Rules, Britannia: An Insider's Guide to Life in the United Kingdom. You never truly feel lose
out for everything should you read some books.

Donald Hamann:

This book untitled Rules, Britannia: An Insider's Guide to Life in the United Kingdom to be one of several
books this best seller in this year, that is because when you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit into it.
You will easily to buy this kind of book in the book retail outlet or you can order it by using online. The
publisher with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, because you can read
this book in your Touch screen phone. So there is no reason for your requirements to past this guide from
your list.

Larry Valadez:

The reserve with title Rules, Britannia: An Insider's Guide to Life in the United Kingdom contains a lot of
information that you can find out it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. That book exist new
expertise the information that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world now. That is
important to yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you with
new era of the globalization. You can read the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read the idea
anywhere you want.

Sally Canady:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information coming
from a book. Book is written or printed or outlined from each source that will filled update of news. Within
this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social such
as newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You can add
your understanding by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just in
search of the Rules, Britannia: An Insider's Guide to Life in the United Kingdom when you needed it?
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