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“Ever since we’ve had this doll,” Elizabeth said hesitantly, “we’ve had funny things happen – the same
dreams and knowing things and stuff like that.”

Twins Jane and Elizabeth are twelve years old and have outgrown dolls. Nevertheless, on a cold wet spring
Saturday they find themselves in an antique store, inexplicably drawn to a small, tattered old fashioned doll.
Even the owner of the store seems to understand that the doll somehow belongs to the girls.

Once the twins buy the doll, stranger and stranger things begin to happen, and a young girl from the past
seems to be calling out to them. The search to discover the history of the little doll brings the twins
terrifyingly close to the world of the supernatural as they finally solve a tantalizing mystery.

Janet Lunn’s first novel, long unavailable, is republished in a fresh, beautiful edition.
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From reader reviews:

Velma Stuart:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important behave,
like looking for your favorite guide and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your short lived problem;
you can add your knowledge by the e-book entitled Double Spell. Try to make book Double Spell as your
friend. It means that it can to be your friend when you feel alone and beside those of course make you
smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you considerably more
confidence because you can know every thing by the book. So , let's make new experience and also
knowledge with this book.

John Harrison:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students because they are still students or that for all people
in the world, what the best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that question above. Every person
has diverse personality and hobby per other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they don't would
like do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Double Spell. All type of book
would you see on many sources. You can look for the internet options or other social media.

Douglas Johnson:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this Double Spell e-book written by well-
known writer whose to say well how to make book that could be understand by anyone who read the book.
Written within good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your
own personal hunger then you still uncertainty Double Spell as good book not simply by the cover but also
from the content. This is one guide that can break don't ascertain book by its protect, so do you still needing
an additional sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already said so why
you have to listening to an additional sixth sense.

Sharon Works:

A lot of guide has printed but it differs. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the most
effective book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is called of
book Double Spell. Contain your knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it might add your
knowledge and make a person happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about reserve. It can
bring you from one destination for a other place.
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