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A biblical adventure with fall-off-your-high-heels humor!

Join Rhonda Rhea, a self-confessed "shoe overachiever," as she walks with you on a biblical journey to
higher places on your God-ward path. She helps you go deeper and feel connected with the one who longs to
get your feet moving in the right direction. High Heels in High Places is a perfect fit for any woman who
needs a reminder to keep looking up, aspiring to go higher. Not only does it show you important scriptural
insight, it also has a discussion guide so you can share the experience with other women. And don't be
surprised if every step holds a chuckle or two. You may even fall off your stiletto heels with laughter.

So what are you waiting for? Strap on those cute shoes and get those high heels in a higher place!

"The heels may be high, but I surely appreciate Rhonda Rhea's down-to-earth, genuine approach to
Colossians 1:9-12. High Heels in High Places will have you laughing one minute and then crying sweet tears
of surrender to our loving God the next. This book, like its author, is unforgettable and totally captivating."--
Jennifer Rothschild, speaker, Women of Faith; author, Lessons I Learned in the Dark

"This book is witty, warm, whimsical, wise, and worthy of reading. Read and see--you'll be glad you did.
The shoe might just fit!"--Thelma Wells, president, A Woman of God Ministries; author, God Is Not
Through with Me Yet

"Reading this book was like taking a walk with a very good friend who helped me enjoy the journey while
leading me into a deeper relationship with God."--Carol Kent, speaker; author, A New Kind of Normal

Radio personality Rhonda Rhea is a funny lady, and, lucky for you, she gets her kicks by speaking at
conferences and women's groups and by writing hilarious books, such as Turkey Soup for the Soul--Tastes
Like Chicken and I'm Dreaming of Some White Chocolate.
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From reader reviews:

Preston Sloan:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As you may know that
book is very important usually. The book High Heels in High Places: Walking Worthy in Way Cute Shoes
has been making you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take more information. It is
rather advantages for you. The guide High Heels in High Places: Walking Worthy in Way Cute Shoes is not
only giving you a lot more new information but also to become your friend when you feel bored. You can
spend your personal spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship with all the book High Heels in
High Places: Walking Worthy in Way Cute Shoes. You never truly feel lose out for everything if you read
some books.

Donovan Houseman:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive today,
people have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice
by means of surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated it for a while is reading.
Yes, by reading a reserve your ability to survive improve then having chance to stand up than other is high.
To suit your needs who want to start reading a book, we give you this particular High Heels in High Places:
Walking Worthy in Way Cute Shoes book as nice and daily reading book. Why, because this book is greater
than just a book.

Joe North:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them family or their
friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or maybe playing
video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity this is look different you can read a new
book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent the entire day to reading
a e-book. The book High Heels in High Places: Walking Worthy in Way Cute Shoes it doesn't matter what
good to read. There are a lot of people who recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this
book. Should you did not have enough space to create this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore
simply to read this book from the smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book possesses high
quality.

Paula Royce:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray anyone, why because this High Heels in High Places: Walking
Worthy in Way Cute Shoes e-book written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book
which might be understand by anyone who all read the book. Written within good manner for you, still
dripping wet every ideas and producing skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still question
High Heels in High Places: Walking Worthy in Way Cute Shoes as good book not just by the cover but also



through the content. This is one e-book that can break don't evaluate book by its handle, so do you still
needing an additional sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already
alerted you so why you have to listening to one more sixth sense.
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