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Four animals must find their ticket out of the circus.

Smalls the sun bear, Tilda the Angora rabbit, Rigby the Komondor dog, and Wombat the wombat are the
four animals that make up "the misfit menagerie."

Together they’ve always lived a happy life on Mr. Mumford’s farm. That is, until one fateful evening when
Mumford, loopy from elderberry wine, accidentally loses them to the dastardly circus owner Grande Master
Claude. Suddenly, these animals are forced to perform death-defying tricks and live in filthy, cramped cages
as members of Claude’s traveling circus. But all hope is not lost! Claude’s nephew Bertie and his friend
Susan, a circus acrobat, are equally fed up with Claude’s evil ways, and together they might just have what it
takes to find their ticket out of the circus.
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From reader reviews:

Marc Gaul:

Within other case, little men and women like to read book The Daring Escape of the Misfit Menagerie. You
can choose the best book if you love reading a book. As long as we know about how is important any book
The Daring Escape of the Misfit Menagerie. You can add knowledge and of course you can around the world
by just a book. Absolutely right, because from book you can learn everything! From your country until
finally foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple thing until wonderful thing you are able to know
that. In this era, we can easily open a book as well as searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You
may use it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's go through.

Mary Brunner:

What do you concerning book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what yours problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy person? If you don't
have spare time to accomplish others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have time? What
did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They have to answer that question since just their
can do that will. It said that about book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is appropriate. Because start
from on pre-school until university need that The Daring Escape of the Misfit Menagerie to read.

Jerry Melgar:

Often the book The Daring Escape of the Misfit Menagerie will bring someone to the new experience of
reading any book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. In the event you try to find new book to
see, this book very suited to you. The book The Daring Escape of the Misfit Menagerie is much
recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book from official web site, so you can more readily to
read the book.

Allison Larson:

Many people spending their time by playing outside together with friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by examining a book. Ugh,
ya think reading a book can actually hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It fine you can
have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like The Daring Escape of the
Misfit Menagerie which is finding the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's notice.
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