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Trust your ABSITE and board preparation to the only review based on the field’s cornerstone text:
Schwartz’s Principles of Surgery, 9e

Featuring chapters that correspond directly to the classic Schwartz’s Principles of Surgery, 9e, this powerful
review delivers more than 1,100 questions that are likely to appear on the American Board of Surgery in-
training exam and the surgery board exam.

Developed by some of the top minds in modern surgery, these board-style questions provide the most
current, authoritative perspectives on surgical practice. Each question is accompanied by answers and
comprehension-building rationales, ensuring a complete understanding of the material. Featuring more tables
and figures than any previous edition, Schwartz’s Principles of Surgery ABSITE and Board Review is truly
the ultimate resource for certification and recertification exam review.

Features

Chapters keyed to Schwartz’s Principles of Surgery, 9e so you know you’re studying only relevant,●

applicable material from the most authoritative source possible
1100+ board-style questions with answers and rationales●

Questions in each chapter are divided into Basic Science and Clinical categories to facilitate studying for●

the two-part ABSITE
Two new chapters: Molecular Biology and Ethics, Palliative Care, and Care at the End of Life●
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From reader reviews:

Sophia Hartman:

The book Schwartz's Principles of Surgery ABSITE and Board Review, Ninth Edition make one feel enjoy
for your spare time. You should use to make your capable far more increase. Book can to get your best friend
when you getting anxiety or having big problem together with your subject. If you can make looking at a
book Schwartz's Principles of Surgery ABSITE and Board Review, Ninth Edition for being your habit, you
can get a lot more advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your knowledge about several or all
subjects. You may know everything if you like start and read a book Schwartz's Principles of Surgery
ABSITE and Board Review, Ninth Edition. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science reserve or
encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think about this publication?

Barbie Brookins:

The publication with title Schwartz's Principles of Surgery ABSITE and Board Review, Ninth Edition has lot
of information that you can find out it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This specific book
exist new understanding the information that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world right
now. That is important to yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you
with new era of the internationalization. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read the
idea anywhere you want.

Heather Robertson:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make anyone to
understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information easier to share.
You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon. You will observe
that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. Typically the book that recommended for your
requirements is Schwartz's Principles of Surgery ABSITE and Board Review, Ninth Edition this book
consist a lot of the information from the condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented how
do the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. The
actual writer made some exploration when he makes this book. That's why this book ideal all of you.

Gordon Miller:

Beside that Schwartz's Principles of Surgery ABSITE and Board Review, Ninth Edition in your phone, it
may give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you
might got here is fresh from your oven so don't be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow
village. It is good thing to have Schwartz's Principles of Surgery ABSITE and Board Review, Ninth Edition
because this book offers for you readable information. Do you at times have book but you don't get what it's
about. Oh come on, that will not happen if you have this with your hand. The Enjoyable agreement here



cannot be questionable, just like treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss the item? Find this
book and also read it from currently!
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