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A cultural history of the last forty years, The Age of American Unreason focuses on the convergence of
social forces-usually treated as separate entities-that has created a perfect storm of anti-rationalism. These
include the upsurge of religious fundamentalism, with more political power today than ever before; the
failure of public education to create an informed citizenry; and the triumph of video over print culture.
Sparing neither the right nor the left, Jacoby asserts that Americans today have embraced a universe of “junk
thought” that makes almost no effort to separate fact from opinion.

From the Trade Paperback edition.
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From reader reviews:

Anthony Anderson:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information these days can get by anyone at everywhere.
The information can be a expertise or any news even a problem. What people must be consider when those
information which is within the former life are hard to be find than now is taking seriously which one is
appropriate to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable resource
then you buy it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities
will not happen in you if you take The Age of American Unreason as your daily resource information.

Dennis James:

The reserve untitled The Age of American Unreason is the reserve that recommended to you to study. You
can see the quality of the book content that will be shown to an individual. The language that creator use to
explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of study when
write the book, hence the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also will get the e-
book of The Age of American Unreason from the publisher to make you far more enjoy free time.

Carolyn Bailey:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their spare time with their family, or all
their friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, going to beach, or picnic in the park.
They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something different to fill your
personal free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book could be option to fill your no cost time/ holiday. The
first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to attempt look for
book, may be the book untitled The Age of American Unreason can be fine book to read. May be it could be
best activity to you.

Sergio Espinoza:

As a scholar exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library or even make
summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's spirit or real their
leisure activity. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to there but nothing
reading significantly. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring along with can't see
colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know
that on this era, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore this The Age of American Unreason can make you feel more interested to read.
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