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In his riveting glimpse into the life of one of the most powerful Secretaries of State in recent years,
Washington Post diplomatic correspondent Glenn Kessler provides not only a revealing look at Condoleezza
Rice but a rich portrait of the Bush administration's controversial foreign policy regime. From her grievous
errors in judgment as national security advisor to her notable influence over the president as Secretary of
State, Rice has not gone unnoticed during her rise to power. But, as an intensely private person, she has--
despite endless media attention--remained a mystery. As the first critical examination of Rice's skills as
policy-maker, politician and manager, this definitive biography explains not only her rise to power, but the
pivotal role she has played in our nation's history.
 
Full of candor as well as honesty, The Confidante shows unseen moments in Rice's life and of her frequently
divisive performance during one of the most tumultuous foreign-policy periods in U.S. history. Drawing on
personal interviews with Rice, an intimacy afforded to Kessler as one of the few reporters granted the
opportunity to travel with her, Kessler takes readers inside the secret meetings Rice has held with foreign
leaders and even her private conversations with President Bush. With access to all of Rice's top aides and
sources in many overseas governments, Kessler also provides dramatic new information about one of the
most secretive administrations in U.S. history.  He shows how Rice molded herself into the image of a
globe-trotting diplomatic super star, negating memories of her past failures. He exposes new details about
her secret role in Israel's withdrawal from Gaza, her maneuvers around government bureaucracy to strike a
pivotal nuclear-energy deal with India, her persuasion of Bush to support a dramatic gesture to Iran, her
failure to prevent the North Korean nuclear test, and her struggle to contain the devastating war between
Israel and Lebanon. This brilliantly written book reveals not only her public and private humiliation of
foreign officials but also how her charm and grace have been successful assets in repairing fractured
relations overseas.
 
Condoleezza Rice remains today and in the future one of the most alluring, controversial, and ultimately
influential decision makers in the United States. With this captivating work, Kessler shows what traits could
solidify her shot at greatness or what cracks in her hard veneer could send her career hurtling to ruin.
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From reader reviews:

Noel Stevens:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you
can add your knowledge by the guide entitled The Confidante: Condoleezza Rice and the Creation of the
Bush Legacy. Try to the actual book The Confidante: Condoleezza Rice and the Creation of the Bush Legacy
as your close friend. It means that it can being your friend when you experience alone and beside associated
with course make you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The book makes you a
lot more confidence because you can know every thing by the book. So , we need to make new experience
and also knowledge with this book.

Ann Birdsell:

Book is definitely written, printed, or created for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important issue to bring us around the world.
Close to that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A reserve The Confidante: Condoleezza Rice
and the Creation of the Bush Legacy will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel considerably more
confidence if you can know about anything. But some of you think that open or reading some sort of book
make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you trying to find best
book or acceptable book with you?

Floyd Eichner:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them friends and
family or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, as
well as playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity here is look different you
can read a book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent 24
hours a day to reading a reserve. The book The Confidante: Condoleezza Rice and the Creation of the Bush
Legacy it is very good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. These were enjoying
reading this book. If you did not have enough space to bring this book you can buy often the e-book. You
can m0ore easily to read this book from the smart phone. The price is not very costly but this book has high
quality.

Sharon Brogdon:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library or to
make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's spirit or real their
leisure activity. They just do what the educator want, like asked to the library. They go to generally there but
nothing reading critically. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring in addition to can't
see colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we



know that on this era, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, many ways to
reach Chinese's country. So , this The Confidante: Condoleezza Rice and the Creation of the Bush Legacy
can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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