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This textbook presents the fundamental concepts and methods for understanding and working with images
and video in an unique, easy-to-read style which ensures the material is accessible to a wide audience.
Exploring more than just the basics of image processing, the text provides a specific focus on the practical
design and implementation of real systems for processing video data. Features: includes more than 100
exercises, as well as C-code snippets of the key algorithms; covers topics on image acquisition, color images,
point processing, neighborhood processing, morphology, BLOB analysis, segmentation in video, tracking,
geometric transformation, and visual effects; requires only a minimal understanding of mathematics; presents
two chapters dedicated to applications; provides a guide to defining suitable values for parameters in video
and image processing systems, and to conversion between the RGB color representation and the HIS, HSV
and YUV/YCbCr color representations.
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From reader reviews:

Shane Bodine:

The book Introduction to Video and Image Processing: Building Real Systems and Applications
(Undergraduate Topics in Computer Science) make you feel enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to
make your capable considerably more increase. Book can being your best friend when you getting pressure
or having big problem with the subject. If you can make reading a book Introduction to Video and Image
Processing: Building Real Systems and Applications (Undergraduate Topics in Computer Science) to get
your habit, you can get more advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your knowledge about a
number of or all subjects. You are able to know everything if you like open and read a guide Introduction to
Video and Image Processing: Building Real Systems and Applications (Undergraduate Topics in Computer
Science). Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science publication or encyclopedia or some others. So ,
how do you think about this reserve?

Eleanor Bender:

The book Introduction to Video and Image Processing: Building Real Systems and Applications
(Undergraduate Topics in Computer Science) can give more knowledge and also the precise product
information about everything you want. Exactly why must we leave the best thing like a book Introduction to
Video and Image Processing: Building Real Systems and Applications (Undergraduate Topics in Computer
Science)? Some of you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim which book can give many
details for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or
info that you take for that, you can give for each other; you can share all of these. Book Introduction to
Video and Image Processing: Building Real Systems and Applications (Undergraduate Topics in Computer
Science) has simple shape however, you know: it has great and big function for you. You can look the
enormous world by open up and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Thomas Palmer:

The publication with title Introduction to Video and Image Processing: Building Real Systems and
Applications (Undergraduate Topics in Computer Science) includes a lot of information that you can
understand it. You can get a lot of gain after read this book. This book exist new understanding the
information that exist in this guide represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to
yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you inside new era of the
internationalization. You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

Isaiah Owen:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got learners? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. Therefore
you know that little person such as reading or as reading become their hobby. You should know that reading



is very important in addition to book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to add you knowledge,
except your current teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update in relation to something by book.
Many kinds of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is niagra Introduction to Video
and Image Processing: Building Real Systems and Applications (Undergraduate Topics in Computer
Science).
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