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Some people have powers.
Some people do not.
And some people just might change the world.
Sarah Robertson is one of those people.

Sarah is no ordinary girl: she can control the weather with her emotions. But in Doolittle Falls where
superheroes walk the streets (and fly over them), Sarah’s powers aren’t enough for admission to the
prestigious Hero Academy. Not to mention that her mother is a notorious Supervillain and the archnemesis
of America’s favorite Hero, Freedom Man. Instead of being accepted to the school of her dreams, Sarah is
marked as an outcast with powers – a Misshape.

Now she’s stuck with a ragtag group of fellow Misshapes, her dreams of heroism on hold indefinitely. Yet
Sarah is determined to harness her powers to win a place at Hero Academy. But the path to greatness won’t
be easy. Her brother’s rebellious streak is starting to wear thin, she has an intriguing (and smoking hot) new
mentor, and an unexpected romance blooms with superstar Hero Freedom Boy. And when Doolittle Falls
comes under threat of annihilation, Sarah has to prove there may be more to the Misshapes than everyone
thinks.

And she may just kick some Supervillain butt in the process.
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From reader reviews:

Lawrence Sawyer:

What do you about book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you need something to
explain what your own problem? How about your time? Or are you busy particular person? If you don't have
spare time to do others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have time? What did you do? All
people has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that question due to the fact just their can do that
will. It said that about guide. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is appropriate. Because start from on
guardería until university need that The Misshapes to read.

Audrey Rivas:

Here thing why this particular The Misshapes are different and reputable to be yours. First of all studying a
book is good however it depends in the content of the usb ports which is the content is as delightful as food
or not. The Misshapes giving you information deeper as different ways, you can find any e-book out there
but there is no book that similar with The Misshapes. It gives you thrill examining journey, its open up your
personal eyes about the thing that happened in the world which is maybe can be happened around you. You
can actually bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your approach home by train. Should you be
having difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of The Misshapes in e-book can be your
option.

David Clark:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many problem for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some
people likes studying, not only science book but also novel and The Misshapes or perhaps others sources
were given information for you. After you know how the fantastic a book, you feel desire to read more and
more. Science reserve was created for teacher as well as students especially. Those books are helping them to
add their knowledge. In some other case, beside science guide, any other book likes The Misshapes to make
your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like here.

Donna Solano:

A lot of people said that they feel uninterested when they reading a book. They are directly felt the idea when
they get a half elements of the book. You can choose the book The Misshapes to make your personal reading
is interesting. Your skill of reading ability is developing when you including reading. Try to choose simple
book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the idea about book and reading especially. It is to be initial
opinion for you to like to start a book and read it. Beside that the guide The Misshapes can to be a newly
purchased friend when you're experience alone and confuse with the information must you're doing of the
time.
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