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Fractured history. Broken lives. Splintered souls. Since the alternate universe was first glimpsed in the
classic episode "Mirror, Mirror," something about Star Trek's dark side has beckoned us, called to us,
tempted us -- like forbidden fruit on the Tree of Knowledge. To taste it is to lose oneself in a world of
startling familiarity and terrifying contradictions, where everything and everyone we knew is somehow
disturbingly different, and where shocking secrets await their revelation.

What began in 2007 with Glass Empires and Obsidian Alliances -- the first truly in-depth foray into the
turbulent history of this other continuum -- now continues in twelve new short tales that revisit and expand
upon that so-called "Mirror Universe," spanning all five of the core incarnations of Star Trek, as well as their
literary offshoots, across more than two hundred years of divergent history, as chronicled by...

Christopher L. Bennett - Margaret Wander Bonanno - Peter David - Keith R.A. DeCandido - Michael Jan
Friedman - Jim Johnson - Rudy Josephs - David Mack - Dave Stern - James Swallow - Dayton Ward &
Kevin Dilmore - Susan Wright
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From reader reviews:

Cathleen Read:

This Star Trek: Mirror Universe: Shards and Shadows book is simply not ordinary book, you have after that
it the world is in your hands. The benefit you have by reading this book is information inside this guide
incredible fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper you read a lot of information you will get. This
Star Trek: Mirror Universe: Shards and Shadows without we realize teach the one who reading it become
critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't become worry Star Trek: Mirror Universe: Shards and Shadows
can bring if you are and not make your bag space or bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it
inside your lovely laptop even phone. This Star Trek: Mirror Universe: Shards and Shadows having good
arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not experience uninterested in reading.

Rickie Miller:

The e-book with title Star Trek: Mirror Universe: Shards and Shadows includes a lot of information that you
can learn it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. This book exist new information the information
that exist in this book represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to understand
how the improvement of the world. This particular book will bring you throughout new era of the the
positive effect. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Louise O\'Neill:

The particular book Star Trek: Mirror Universe: Shards and Shadows has a lot details on it. So when you
check out this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was published by the very famous author. This
articles author makes some research before write this book. This book very easy to read you can obtain the
point easily after perusing this book.

Helen Noyola:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with close friends is thing that
usually you may have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try point that really
opposite from that. One activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you have been ride on and with addition info. Even you love Star Trek: Mirror Universe: Shards and
Shadows, it is possible to enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of
hangout type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its named reading
friends.
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