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Traces the many parallels between the Old Testament (and Bible as a whole) and the ancient Near East,
including creation and flood narratives, common literary and legal forms, supposed acts of deities and the
God of the Bible, and more. Instead of merely studying a random selection of parallels, however, Jeffrey
Niehaus proposes that they represent "a shared theological structure of ideas in the ancient Near East, a
structure that finds its most complete and true form in the Old and New Testaments." This comprehensive
and enlightening resource promises to help students and discerning Bible readers to intellectually grasp and
appreciate the overarching story of the Bible within its cultural development.
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From reader reviews:

Melvin Loch:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them
loved ones or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching
TV, or even playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity that is look different
you can read a new book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book which you read you can
spent all day every day to reading a guide. The book Ancient Near Eastern Themes in Biblical Theology it is
extremely good to read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. These people were enjoying
reading this book. In case you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy often the e-book.
You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book from the smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this
book features high quality.

David Anthony:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book than can
satisfy your small amount of time to read it because all this time you only find reserve that need more time to
be study. Ancient Near Eastern Themes in Biblical Theology can be your answer because it can be read by
you who have those short time problems.

Octavio Martin:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our expertise for everything. By a book we can know
everything we want. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This e-book Ancient Near Eastern Themes in Biblical Theology was filled in relation to
science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has several
feel when they reading a book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you can sense enjoy to read a
publication. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book that you wanted.

David Hosford:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book seemed to be
rare? Why so many question for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some
people likes examining, not only science book and also novel and Ancient Near Eastern Themes in Biblical
Theology or even others sources were given knowledge for you. After you know how the great a book, you
feel desire to read more and more. Science e-book was created for teacher as well as students especially.
Those textbooks are helping them to bring their knowledge. In other case, beside science book, any other
book likes Ancient Near Eastern Themes in Biblical Theology to make your spare time far more colorful.
Many types of book like here.
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