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A mere 73 days after a ragtag South Carolina militia attacked Fort Sumter launching the War Between the
States, a band of railroad executives and politicians from 27 Virginia counties met in Wheeling, then
Virginia's third largest city, and laid the foundation for our nation's 35th state, West Virginia. Born amidst
the Sturm und Drang of our nation's most tragic and disruptive event, West Virginia is the first and only state
created from another state without the parent state's consent. The lore which emerged was purposefully
designed to imbue its citizens with pride and righteous purpose. The border is as craggy and haphazard as the
topography upon which it was superimposed, a beautiful, tragic, and widely misunderstood swath of the
central Appalachia. Michael Abraham was raised as a member of an ethnic minority by a Northern father and
a Southern mother in a small southwest Virginia town. With Blue Bloods to the east, hillbillies to the west,
and evangelical Christians everywhere, he forged an egalitarian ethos and a kinship with those who tied their
fortunes, sensibilities, and affections to rugged, isolated areas. In The Spine of the Virginias, Abraham chips
away at the West Virginia formation myth. He follows with a collection of contemporary vignettes of people
and places on both sides of the border of Virginia and West Virginia, in revealing looks at the interaction
between a landscape and its people. Inspired by the quote, "Culture is something we think other people
have," Abraham profiles doctors, lawyers, journalists, miners, and businesspeople; senators, mayors, and
gubernatorial candidates; filmmakers, musicians, and artists; beekeepers, maple syrup producers, brick
sculptors, and barbarians. This palette is infused with green and brown earthtones, the canvas is a richly
corrugated and rugged parchment, and the patina is a pall of resentment, resignation, affection, divided
loyalties, and constitutional ambiguities.
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From reader reviews:

James Goodman:

This book untitled The Spine of the Virginias to be one of several books this best seller in this year, this is
because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit on it. You will easily to buy this kind of book
in the book shop or you can order it via online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It makes you
quicker to read this book, since you can read this book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason to you to
past this publication from your list.

Joseph Gee:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world can certainly share
their idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire all their reader with their story
or maybe their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the publications. But also they write about the
knowledge about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
sons or daughters, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors these days always try to
improve their ability in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write to the book. One of them is
this The Spine of the Virginias.

Kimberly Wood:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind skill
or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book than can
satisfy your small amount of time to read it because all this time you only find book that need more time to
be study. The Spine of the Virginias can be your answer because it can be read by you actually who have
those short extra time problems.

Amado Spieker:

Reading a book to get new life style in this year; every people loves to study a book. When you read a book
you can get a lot of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, mainly because
book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book that
you have read. If you want to get information about your research, you can read education books, but if you
want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, as well as soon. The The
Spine of the Virginias provide you with new experience in reading through a book.
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