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In the villages and small towns of Oaxaca, Mexico, as in much of rural Latin America, cooperation among
neighbors is essential for personal and community survival. It can take many forms, from godparenting to
sponsoring fiestas, holding civic offices, or exchanging agricultural or other kinds of labor. This book
examines the ways in which the people of Santa Ana del Valle practice these traditional cooperative and
reciprocal relationships and also invent new relationships to respond to global forces of social and economic
change at work within their community.

Based on fieldwork he conducted in this Zapotec-speaking community between 1992 and 1996, Jeffrey
Cohen describes continuities in the Santañeros' practices of cooperation, as well as changes resulting from
transnational migration, tourism, increasing educational opportunities, and improved communications. His
nuanced portrayal of the benefits and burdens of cooperation is buttressed by the words of many villagers
who explain why and how they participate-or not-in reciprocal family and community networks. This rich
ethnographic material offers a working definition of community created in and through cooperative
relationships.
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From reader reviews:

Linda Cunningham:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important thing for
us to be aware of everything in the world. Each guide has different aim as well as goal; it means that
publication has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They can be
reading whatever they acquire because their hobby will be reading a book. Think about the person who don't
like studying a book? Sometime, person feel need book when they found difficult problem or exercise. Well,
probably you'll have this Cooperation and Community: Economy and Society in Oaxaca.

Myron Mendez:

Do you among people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on guys this
particular aren't like that. This Cooperation and Community: Economy and Society in Oaxaca book is
readable by you who hate those straight word style. You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable
looking at experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to deliver to you. The writer
of Cooperation and Community: Economy and Society in Oaxaca content conveys prospect easily to
understand by many individuals. The printed and e-book are not different in the articles but it just different in
the form of it. So , do you nevertheless thinking Cooperation and Community: Economy and Society in
Oaxaca is not loveable to be your top list reading book?

Michael Barth:

The book untitled Cooperation and Community: Economy and Society in Oaxaca contain a lot of
information on that. The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy method. The language is very clear to
see all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read that. The book was published by famous
author. The author gives you in the new era of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can
please read on your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book with anywhere and anytime. If you
want to buy the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice examine.

Ryan Harrison:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our information for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we wish. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year has been
exactly added. This e-book Cooperation and Community: Economy and Society in Oaxaca was filled
concerning science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines
competence. Some people has various feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big
benefit from a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like today, many ways
to get book which you wanted.
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