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Gunfire disrupts a Christmas wedding in this 2-in-1 collection of original, connected novellas. 

 

Rescuing the Witness by Beth Cornelison 

Bullets are fired at a ranch wedding in Texas and the only witness to the unknown sniper's identity is
wedding guest Kara Pearson. When the rifle turns to her, Kara runs for her life. Her only hope for survival?
The man who broke her heart years ago. But Sheriff Brady McCall vows to protect Kara—and right old
wrongs. 

 

Rescuing the Bride by Colleen Thompson 

After being jilted and having gunfire erupt at his wedding, bull rider turned rancher Nate Wheeler fears his
pregnant bride is the intended target. But as he and April Redding try to track down the shooter, Nate
uncovers the secret reason April refused to say "I do" at their ceremony.
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From reader reviews:

Vincent Baker:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem;
you can add your knowledge by the e-book entitled Cowboy Christmas Rescue: Rescuing the
Witness/Rescuing the Bride (Harlequin Romantic Suspense). Try to make the book Cowboy Christmas
Rescue: Rescuing the Witness/Rescuing the Bride (Harlequin Romantic Suspense) as your pal. It means that
it can being your friend when you really feel alone and beside that course make you smarter than previously.
Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you a lot more confidence because you can know
anything by the book. So , we need to make new experience as well as knowledge with this book.

Elnora Perry:

The book Cowboy Christmas Rescue: Rescuing the Witness/Rescuing the Bride (Harlequin Romantic
Suspense) give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make your capable a lot
more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you getting strain or having big problem along with
your subject. If you can make examining a book Cowboy Christmas Rescue: Rescuing the Witness/Rescuing
the Bride (Harlequin Romantic Suspense) for being your habit, you can get far more advantages, like add
your personal capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all subjects. You may know everything if you
like wide open and read a publication Cowboy Christmas Rescue: Rescuing the Witness/Rescuing the Bride
(Harlequin Romantic Suspense). Kinds of book are several. It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or
other folks. So , how do you think about this guide?

Amy Mueller:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book thus.
There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new facts. When
you read a book you will get new information due to the fact book is one of various ways to share the
information or their idea. Second, examining a book will make an individual more imaginative. When you
reading through a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story
how the characters do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to other folks. When you read this
Cowboy Christmas Rescue: Rescuing the Witness/Rescuing the Bride (Harlequin Romantic Suspense), you
may tells your family, friends along with soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire the others,
make them reading a book.

Ollie Waymire:

Book is one of source of understanding. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen need book to know the up-date information of year for you to year. As we know
those ebooks have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world. By



book Cowboy Christmas Rescue: Rescuing the Witness/Rescuing the Bride (Harlequin Romantic Suspense)
we can have more advantage. Don't one to be creative people? Being creative person must like to read a
book. Just choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't always be doubt to change your life
with this book Cowboy Christmas Rescue: Rescuing the Witness/Rescuing the Bride (Harlequin Romantic
Suspense). You can more attractive than now.
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