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Introducing a handbook for gene regulatory network research using evolutionary computation, with
applications for computer scientists, computational and system biologists

This book is a step-by-step guideline for research in gene regulatory networks (GRN) using evolutionary
computation (EC). The book is organized into four parts that deliver materials in a way equally attractive for
a reader with training in computation or biology. Each of these sections, authored by well-known researchers
and experienced practitioners, provides the relevant materials for the interested readers. The first part of this
book contains an introductory background to the field. The second part presents the EC approaches for
analysis and reconstruction of GRN from gene expression data. The third part of this book covers the
contemporary advancements in the automatic construction of gene regulatory and reaction networks and
gives direction and guidelines for future research. Finally, the last part of this book focuses on applications of
GRNs with EC in other fields, such as design, engineering and robotics.

• Provides a reference for current and future research in gene regulatory networks (GRN) using evolutionary
computation (EC)

• Covers sub-domains of GRN research using EC, such as expression profile analysis, reverse engineering,
GRN evolution, applications

• Contains useful contents for courses in gene regulatory networks, systems biology, computational biology,
and synthetic biology

• Delivers state-of-the-art research in genetic algorithms, genetic programming, and swarm intelligence

Evolutionary Computation in Gene Regulatory Network Research is a reference for researchers and
professionals in computer science, systems biology, and bioinformatics, as well as upper undergraduate,
graduate, and postgraduate students.

Hitoshi Iba is a Professor in the Department of Information and Communication Engineering, Graduate
School of Information Science and Technology, at the University of Tokyo, Toyko, Japan. He is an
Associate Editor of the IEEE Transactions on Evolutionary Computation and the journal of Genetic
Programming and Evolvable Machines.
 
Nasimul Noman is a lecturer in the School of Electrical Engineering and Computer Science at the
University of Newcastle, NSW, Australia. From 2002 to 2012 he was a faculty member at the University of
Dhaka, Bangladesh. Noman is an Editor of the BioMed Research International journal. His research interests
include computational biology, synthetic biology, and bioinformatics.
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From reader reviews:

Raymond Harris:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students since they are still students or the idea for all people in
the world, the particular best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that issue above. Every person
has various personality and hobby per other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they don't want
do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Evolutionary Computation in Gene
Regulatory Network Research (Wiley Series in Bioinformatics). All type of book is it possible to see on
many sources. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Peter White:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even restricted. What people must be
consider if those information which is inside the former life are hard to be find than now's taking seriously
which one is acceptable to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you obtain the
unstable resource then you have it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take Evolutionary Computation in Gene Regulatory
Network Research (Wiley Series in Bioinformatics) as your daily resource information.

Joshua Mack:

Often the book Evolutionary Computation in Gene Regulatory Network Research (Wiley Series in
Bioinformatics) will bring that you the new experience of reading the book. The author style to elucidate the
idea is very unique. In the event you try to find new book to learn, this book very suited to you. The book
Evolutionary Computation in Gene Regulatory Network Research (Wiley Series in Bioinformatics) is much
recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book from the official web site, so you can easier to
read the book.

Rhonda Rudder:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Evolutionary Computation in Gene Regulatory
Network Research (Wiley Series in Bioinformatics) was multi-colored and of course has pictures on there.
As we know that book Evolutionary Computation in Gene Regulatory Network Research (Wiley Series in
Bioinformatics) has many kinds or category. Start from kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or
Investigation company Conan you can read and believe that you are the character on there. Therefore not at
all of book are usually make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the
best book for you personally and try to like reading that.
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