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From the acclaimed author of Conquistador comes this thrilling account of one of history’s greatest
adventures of discovery. With cinematic immediacy and meticulous attention to historical detail, here is the
true story of a legendary sixteenth-century explorer and his death-defying navigation of the Amazon—river
of darkness, pathway to gold.

In 1541, the brutal conquistador Gonzalo Pizarro and his well-born lieutenant Francisco Orellana set off
from Quito in search of La Canela, South America’s rumored Land of Cinnamon, and the fabled El Dorado,
“the golden man.” Driving an enormous retinue of mercenaries, enslaved natives, horses, hunting dogs, and
other animals across the Andes, they watched their proud expedition begin to disintegrate even before they
descended into the nightmarish jungle, following the course of a powerful river. Soon hopelessly lost in the
swampy labyrinth, their numbers diminishing daily through disease, starvation, and Indian attacks, Pizarro
and Orellana made a fateful decision to separate. While Pizarro eventually returned home barefoot and in
rags, Orellana and fifty-seven men, in a few fragile craft, continued downriver into the unknown reaches of
the mighty Amazon, serenaded by native war drums and the eerie cries of exotic predators. Theirs would be
the greater glory.
 
Interweaving eyewitness accounts of the quest with newly uncovered details, Buddy Levy reconstructs the
seminal journey that has electrified adventurers ever since, as Orellana became the first European to navigate
and explore the entire length of the world’s largest river. Levy gives a long-overdue account of the native
populations—some peaceful and welcoming, offering sustenance and life-saving guidance, others
ferociously hostile, subjecting the invaders to gauntlets of unremitting attack and intimations of terrifying
rituals. And here is the Amazon itself, a powerful presence whose every twist and turn held the promise of
new wonders both natural and man-made, as well as the ever-present risk of death—a river that would hold
Orellana in its irresistible embrace to the end of his life.

Overflowing with violence and beauty, nobility and tragedy, River of Darkness is both riveting history and a
breathtaking adventure that will sweep readers along on an epic voyage unlike any other.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Rita Hackett:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for us to
learn everything in the world. Each publication has different aim as well as goal; it means that reserve has
different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They may be
reading whatever they have because their hobby is usually reading a book. What about the person who don't
like examining a book? Sometime, person feel need book once they found difficult problem or even exercise.
Well, probably you will require this River of Darkness: Francisco Orellana's Legendary Voyage of Death
and Discovery Down the Amazon.

Angela Hampton:

This River of Darkness: Francisco Orellana's Legendary Voyage of Death and Discovery Down the Amazon
book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you will
get by reading this book will be information inside this book incredible fresh, you will get facts which is
getting deeper you read a lot of information you will get. That River of Darkness: Francisco Orellana's
Legendary Voyage of Death and Discovery Down the Amazon without we realize teach the one who looking
at it become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't be worry River of Darkness: Francisco Orellana's
Legendary Voyage of Death and Discovery Down the Amazon can bring if you are and not make your
handbag space or bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it with your lovely laptop even mobile
phone. This River of Darkness: Francisco Orellana's Legendary Voyage of Death and Discovery Down the
Amazon having good arrangement in word in addition to layout, so you will not truly feel uninterested in
reading.

Debra Davis:

This River of Darkness: Francisco Orellana's Legendary Voyage of Death and Discovery Down the Amazon
are usually reliable for you who want to be a successful person, why. The main reason of this River of
Darkness: Francisco Orellana's Legendary Voyage of Death and Discovery Down the Amazon can be one of
the great books you must have is usually giving you more than just simple reading through food but feed an
individual with information that possibly will shock your earlier knowledge. This book is actually handy,
you can bring it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions at e-book and printed kinds. Beside that
this River of Darkness: Francisco Orellana's Legendary Voyage of Death and Discovery Down the Amazon
forcing you to have an enormous of experience for instance rich vocabulary, giving you trial run of critical
thinking that we all know it useful in your day action. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Tamela Campbell:

This River of Darkness: Francisco Orellana's Legendary Voyage of Death and Discovery Down the Amazon
is brand-new way for you who has curiosity to look for some information as it relief your hunger details.



Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more you know otherwise you who still having little digest in
reading this River of Darkness: Francisco Orellana's Legendary Voyage of Death and Discovery Down the
Amazon can be the light food to suit your needs because the information inside this book is easy to get
through anyone. These books acquire itself in the form which is reachable by anyone, that's why I mean in
the e-book application form. People who think that in reserve form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this e-
book is the answer. So you cannot find any in reading a publication especially this one. You can find what
you are looking for. It should be here for a person. So , don't miss the item! Just read this e-book variety for
your better life and knowledge.
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