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How does a real-life Zen master — not the preternaturally calm, cartoonish Zen masters depicted by
mainstream culture — help others through hard times when he's dealing with pain of his own? How does he
meditate when the world is crumbling around him? Is meditation a valid response or just another form of
escapism? These are the questions Brad Warner ponders in Zen Wrapped in Karma Dipped in Chocolate.
During a year that Warner spent giving talks and leading retreats across North America, his mother and
grandmother died, he lost his dream job, and his marriage fell apart. In writing about how he applied the
Buddha's teachings to his own real-life suffering, Warner shatters expectations, revealing that Buddhism isn't
some esoteric pie-in-the-sky ultimate solution but an exceptionally practical way to deal with whatever life
dishes out.
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From reader reviews:

Edward Torres:

The book Zen Wrapped in Karma Dipped in Chocolate can give more knowledge and also the precise
product information about everything you want. Exactly why must we leave a good thing like a book Zen
Wrapped in Karma Dipped in Chocolate? Wide variety you have a different opinion about book. But one aim
in which book can give many information for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer with
your book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you may give for each other; it is possible to share all
of these. Book Zen Wrapped in Karma Dipped in Chocolate has simple shape however you know: it has
great and large function for you. You can look the enormous world by start and read a book. So it is very
wonderful.

Larry Parrish:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the subject Zen Wrapped in
Karma Dipped in Chocolate suitable to you? Typically the book was written by well known writer in this era.
The particular book untitled Zen Wrapped in Karma Dipped in Chocolateis the one of several books that will
everyone read now. That book was inspired a number of people in the world. When you read this book you
will enter the new dimension that you ever know previous to. The author explained their plan in the simple
way, thus all of people can easily to comprehend the core of this publication. This book will give you a great
deal of information about this world now. In order to see the represented of the world in this book.

Lawrence Scuderi:

Beside this particular Zen Wrapped in Karma Dipped in Chocolate in your phone, it can give you a way to
get closer to the new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you are going to got here is
fresh from the oven so don't become worry if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow small town. It is
good thing to have Zen Wrapped in Karma Dipped in Chocolate because this book offers to you readable
information. Do you oftentimes have book but you do not get what it's facts concerning. Oh come on, that
won't happen if you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable agreement here cannot be questionable, like
treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss that? Find this book as well as read it from at this
point!

William Looney:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book ended up being rare? Why
so many issue for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people likes looking at,
not only science book but additionally novel and Zen Wrapped in Karma Dipped in Chocolate or maybe
others sources were given expertise for you. After you know how the truly great a book, you feel desire to
read more and more. Science book was created for teacher or perhaps students especially. Those textbooks
are helping them to include their knowledge. In additional case, beside science reserve, any other book likes
Zen Wrapped in Karma Dipped in Chocolate to make your spare time considerably more colorful. Many



types of book like here.
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